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STARS OF THE WEEK:                                                                                    7th February 2025   
 
 
Bees. Kalki: Over the last couple of weeks, Kalki has been impressing us with his improved 
concentration and listening. He is showing us that he is ready to learn and has been making 
good choices when playing. In phonics, he is blending with more confidence and loves trying 
to spot the digraphs in our daily sentence. Keep showing us your super listening, Kalki. You 
are making us proud. 
 
Butterflies. Ava: This week Ava has been a superstar. She is really focussing in phonics and 
guided reading and is really trying hard to sound talk and blend her words. Her letter 
formation is becoming much more consistent, and we are so proud of her each and every 
day. She is a great friend and a super role model. Well done, Ava! 
 
Squirrels. Jaxon: Jaxon has been a real superstar this week. He has been so enthusiastic in 
all lessons, especially English. He has been able to retell his own version of a story brilliantly 
and it has been wonderful to see. We are so proud of him! Well done, Jaxon – keep it up! 
 
Frogs. Lily: Lily has been such a super star all week! Lily always makes the right choices, 
always listens during lessons, and always tries her best when it is time to do her work. She 
has worked so hard during her writing this week, and I am so impressed with her sentences. 
Well done, Lily! 
 
Mice. Lilly-Mae: For a super improvement in her handwriting, always setting a great 
example and writing some fantastic stories over the past couple of weeks. Well done, Lily-
Mae you always set a super example.  
 
Hedgehogs. Gracie-Mai: For being resilient and smiling at school when sometimes it’s hard. 
 
Moles. Reuben: Reuben has made a huge effort this term, especially in Geography and 
handwriting. I was so impressed this week when he wrote page after page in Geography and 
was so pleased with how proud he was of his work. I can tell that Reuben is trying his 
hardest and I hope he keeps it up! 
 
Rabbits. Riya: For putting a lot of effort into concentrating and trying really hard with her 
writing. Well done, Riya. 
 
Badgers. Kainat: Every day Kainat works hard and listens well.  She is kind, helpful and 
always tries her best in every lesson. Well done, Kainat. 
 

http://www.richardboningtonprimaryschool.co.uk/


Foxes. Grayson: Grayson is my always child. He tries really hard with all his work and listens 
well to everyone in class. Well done, Grayson! 

Kingfishers. Lily: Lily has worked really hard to edit and improve her spelling and 

punctuation! As a result, her writing has really improved. Well done, for all of your amazing 

effort this week Lily! 

Owls. Elle: Elle has really impressed me this week. She has shown such resilience and hard 
work with her Maths and today she was so focussed. She explained her mathematic thinking 
brilliantly to support her friend. Well done, Elle – you are a super star! 
 
Kestrels. Molly: Molly needs recognition for her hard-working attitude and effort that she 
displays every day at school. She gives 100% to everything she does and is always willing to 
support her peers when needing it. She is polite, helpful and a delight to teach.  
 
Sparrowhawks. Megan: Megan has been working so hard to produce some great pieces of 
suspense writing in Y6. She has also shown her creativity and great teamwork skills in our 
fairground project. She is smashing everything in Y6 and should be really proud of her 
achievements so far this year! 


